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Purpose
The potential for organised sports to promote health has been
underexploited so far, according to researchers and policy-
makers. Sports clubs have limited capacity to promote health
due to their voluntary nature and have called for support from
their national sports federations. The present article provides
guidelines based on health promoting sports clubs theoretical
foundations, and an analysis of practical tools and proven
strategies to support national sports federations’ investment in
health promotion (HP).
Methods
A qualitative iterative study was undertaken, based on five
two-hour meetings of a group of 15 international researchers
in health promotion in sports clubs. Notes and minutes from
meetings, as well as shared outputs were analyzed based on the
health promoting sports club framework.

Results
Guidelines for national sports federations to promote health
includes a definition of a health promoting sports federation, a
description of the settings-based approach stages adapted to
national sports federations, as well as practical applications of
the health promoting sports club’s intervention strategies. The
analysis of existing tools demonstrated that most tools are
centered on a single dimension of health (social, mental,
physical, spiritual or community), and often on a specific health
topic. Furthermore, they do not cover HP as a continuous
process or support of sports clubs’ members health, but are
generally short-term programs. The HPSF clarifies theoretical
concepts, their practical implementation via case studies and
outlines intervention components and tools useful for sports
federations in their implementation of HP.
Conclusions
The guidelines are meant to facilitate national sports federa-
tions to acknowledge, reinforce and foster their further
investment in HP.
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